
Pressure boosting unit 
PPT BL

PPT   BL   2   -   6   -  P2V   P2F 

PPT Pressure boosting unit

BL Pump type

2  The flow rate of one pump

6  Number of impellers

P2V Number of frequency regulated pumps

P1F Number of frequency unregulated pumps

USAGE:
• Sanitary water

• Maintaining and increasing the pressure in

    big systems (irrigation systems)

• Residential buildings

• Health facilities

• Administrative buildings

• Industrial buildings

• Hotels

• & more

PROPERTIES:
• Medium - Sanitary water, pH from 5 to 8

• Working temperature -  from 0°C to 120°C

• Ambient temperature - up to 40°C

• Relative humidity - <95%

• Max operating pressure - 1.0 MPa
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Conformity with standards 
and regulations: 
- EN1717:2001
Protection against pollution 
of potable water in water 
installations and general 
requirements of devices to 
prevent pollution by back-
flow
- DIN 2000 
Central drinking water 
supply - Guidelines regard-
ing requirements for drink-
ing water, planning, 
construction, operation and 
maintenance of supply 
plants
- TrinkwV2001 
Ordinance on the quality of 
water intended for human 
consumption
- 4MS Initiative - Acceptance 
of Metallic Materials Used 
for Products in Contact with 
Drinking Water – 4MS 
Common Composition List


